Air Filter Bid # 24-05 Tabulations

A. POLYESTER AWAY FILTERS

Size Air Filters Inc. Johnson Supply Transtar A/C Supply
20x27x1 $3.50 No Bid $2.88
16x20x1 $1.25 $1.33 $0.89
16x16x1 $1.89 $1.34 $0.98
15x20x1 $1.46 $1.27 $0.95
12x16x1 $1.79 $3.20 $1.16
20x22 1/4x1 $3.94 $1.73 $1.25
18x18x1 $1.86 $1.84 $1.33
12x20x1 $1.46 $1.33 $0.95
11x15x1 $3.00 No Bid $219
16 7/8x16 7/8x1 $3.50 No Bid $2.39
10x10x1 $1.40 $1.33 $0.95
10x15x1 $3.10 No Bid $219
20x25x1 $1.47 $1.01 $0.95
18x20x1 $1.89 $1.72 $1.24
17x19x1 $3.57 No Bid $251

12x24x1 $1.30 $1.02 $0.95
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B. PLEATED FILTERS

Size Air Filters Inc  Johnson Supply Transtar A/C Supply Inc
20x20x4 $4.46 No Bid $3.99
16x20x2 $2.46 No Bid $217
16x25x2 $2.68 No Bid $219
20x20x2 $2.73 No Bid $252
20x25x%2 $2.94 No Bid $2.88
24x24x2 $3.00 No Bid $3.22
12x24x2 $225 No Bid No Bid
16x16x1 $3.57 No Bid $4.60
16x20x1 $221 No Bid $2.00
20x20x1 $242 No Bid $2.23
20x25x1 $2.63 No Bid $2.55
24x24x1 $2.80 No Bid $2.89
12x24x1 $220 No Bid $1.99
16x25x1 $2.33 No Bid $2.19

16x30x1 $4.00 No Bid $5.25
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C. ALUMINUM MESH WASHABLE FILTERS FRAMES

Size Air Filters Inc.  Johnson Supply Transtar A/C Supply Inc
16x20x1 $15.10 No Bid No Bid
16x25x1 $16.75 No Bid No Bid
16x30x1 $18.20 No Bid No Bid
20x20x1 $16.75 No Bid No Bid
20x25x1 $19.20 No Bid No Bid

D. POLYESTER MEDIA

Size Air Filters Inc. Johnson Supply Transtar A/C Supply Inc
16” x 90°x 1” $16.43 No Bid No Bid
20” x90°x 1” $19.30 No Bid No Bid
44” x 90°x 1” $47.40 No Bid No Bid
48” x 90°’x 1” $47.62 No Bid No Bid

E. GALVANIZED PAD HOLDING FRAMES

Size Air Filters Inc. Johnson Supply Transtar A/C Supply Inc
16x20x1 $7.35 No Bid No Bid
12x20x1 $7.35 No Bid No Bid
20x25x1 $38.00 No Bid No Bid
12x24x1 $7.35 No Bid No Bid
16x20x2 $7.61 No Bid No Bid
16x25x2 $7.61 No Bid No Bid
20x20x2 $7.61 No Bid No Bid

20x25x2 $8.14 No Bid No Bid
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Size Air Filters Inc. Johnson Supply
24x24x2 $8.93 No Bid
12x24x2 $7.35 No Bid
20x20x1 $7.35 No Bid
20x25x1 $8.00 No Bid
24x24x1 $8.55 No Bid
12x24x1 $7.35 No Bid
16x25x1 $7.35 No Bid
16x30x1 $9.40 No Bid

F. WIRE MESH WASHABLE FILTERS

Size Air Filters Inc. Johnson Supply
16X30X1 $22.50 No Bid
20X20X1 $20.00 No Bid

20X25X1 $22.50 No Bid
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