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Bid#25-08
PREBOUND
PUBLISHER'S| SCHOOL TRADE SHORT SPANISH PAPERBACK | PROCESSING
VENDOR BINDING BINDING BINDING TITLES LANGUAGE BINDING PER BOOK
BAKER & TAYLOR 22.00% 22.00% 41.00% 5.00% VARIOUS 25.00% 0.69
THE BOOKSOURCE 25.00% 25.00% 25.00% 10.00% 25.00% 25.00% 0
BRODART 22.00% 22.00% 45.00% 13.00% VARIOUS VARIOUS 0.94
BOUND TO STAY BOUND NO BID NO BID 30.00% NO BID 30.00% NO BID 1.04
CAPSTONE PRESS NO BID 25.00% NO BID NO BID 25.00% NO BID $12./PER ORDER
CHILDREN'S PLUS 25.00% 25.00% 25.00% 25.00% 25.00% 25.00% VARIOUS
COMPASS POINT NO BID 25.00% NO BID NO BID 25.00% NO BID $12./PER ORDER
DLB EDUCATIONAL 0-30% 0-30% 0-30% NO BID 0-30% 0-30% 0.99
FOLLETT LIBRARY VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS .69-1.09
GARRETT EDUCATIONAL 30.00% 30.00% NO BID NO BID 30.00% NO BID 0.69
GUMDROP BOOKS 0-65% 0-65% 0-65% NO BID 0-65% NO BID 0.99
LERNER PUBLISHING 25.00% 25.00% NO BID NO BID 25.00% NO BID 1.45
MACKIN LIBRARY MEDIA 0-30% 0-30% 0-40% 0-15% 0-40% 0-35% NO CHARGE
PICTURE WINDOW BOOKS NO BID 25.00% NO BID NO BID 25.00% NO BID $12./PER ORDER
RAINBOW BOOKS 25.00% 25.00% 10-25% NO BID 10-25% 25.00% NO CHARGE
SAGEBRUSH 36.00% 36.00% 36.00% NO BID 36.00% 36.00% NO CHARGE
SCHOLASTIC 30.00% NO BID 40.00% NO BID VARIOUS NO BID VARIOUS
STONE ARCH BOOKS NO BID 25.00% NO BID NO BID 25.00% NO BID $12./PER ORDER
THOMPSON GALE VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS VARIOUS
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